Crystal City Code L : 420.01 (Rev. 2007)

Section 420 - Housing and redevelopment

¥

420.01. Housing and redevelopment authorify; membership. The commissioners of the housing and
redevelopment authority of the city of Crystal will consist of no more than three members of the city council
and no less than two other residents of the city, all of whom are appointed by the mayor with the approval of
the city council. For the purposes of this ordinance, the mayor is a member of the council.

420.03. Vacancies. If a member of the city council who is a commissioner vacates the office of
councilmember, or if the councilmember completes the term of office and is not re-elected to the office, the
council must declare the office of commissioner vacant, and the vacancy is to be filled by appointment for the
uncompleted portion of the term. The person so appointed need not be a councilmember.

420.05. Authority. This ordinance is enacted pursuant to the provisions of Laws of Minnesota 1974, chapter
124, and the Minnesota housing and redevelopment act,

(NOTE: This section is included for informational purposes only. The Crystal economic development
authority exercises the powers of the housing and redevelopment authority.)

Section 425'41"rope§.ty' "E'?r’naintenance code
(Repealed, Ord, 2007-06)
(Added, Or_d;v 2007-06)

425.01. Short title. This section may be cited as "The city of Crystal property maintenance code", or the
"property maintenance code". ' ‘ Lt

425.03. Policy: purpose: objectives; intent. Subdivision 1. Policy. It is the policy of the city to enhance
the supply of safe, sanitary and adequate housing for its citizens and to prevent the deterioration of
property in the city, including buildings, other structures, site improvements and landscaping.

Subd. 2. Purpose. The purpose of the property maintenance code is to carry out the policy stated
in subdivision 1 by establishing minimum standards and procedures for its enforcement for the protection
of life, limb, health, property, safety, and welfare of the general public and the owners and occupants of
buildings and property.

Subd. 3. Objectives. The objectives of this code include, but are not limited to, the following: .

a) Protection and preservation of thq_stabilit}f;?.quality and character of all areas and structures in
the city. s -»



Crystal City Code 425.03, Subd. 4

b)

f)

(Rev. 2007)

The prevention and correction of conditions that adversely affect or are likely to adversely
affect the life, safety, and general welfare and health, including the physical, mental and
social well-being of persons occupying or utilizing structures in the city.

The establishment of minimum standards for light, ventilation, cooling, heating and sanitary
equipment necessary to insure health and safety.

The establishment of minimum standards for the maintenance of property, and thus to prevent
deterioration and blight.

The prevention of overcrowdmg of dwellmgs by providing minimum space standards per
occupant for each dwelling umt '

The preservation of the value of lgnd and Eéildings in the city.

Subd. 4. Intent; relation to the provisions of 'citv code. The city council intends that the property
maintenance code be an integral part of the city's program of health, safety, building, and land use
regulation. This code is to be construed liberally in cenjunction with other provisions of the city code to
give effect to the policy, purpose, and objectives of this section, but is not to be construed to modify,
amend or otherwise alter the provisions of the city code relating to health, safety, building or land use

regulation.

Subd. 5. General requirements.

a)

b)

c)

d

.The requirements of this property maintenance code shall apply to all buildings, structures

and property within the city. -

All buildings and portions of buildings, including mechanical, electrical, plumbing and other
building systems, previously constructed or installed in accordance with the city and state
codes, must be maintained in conformlty With the requirements of the codes in effect at the
time of construction or mstalla‘aon

State statutes and codes that apply to or affect existing buildings are considered part of the
code. :

Specific requirements of other séc.’fionsiof this code, including, but not limited to, zoning, fire
and nuisances, shall supersede the general requirements of section 425 of this code.

In cases where a conflict may occur between requirements of this section or other codes, the
requirements providing the greatest degree of life safety, property maintenance and general
welfare to the city shall govern.




Crystal City Code K S 425.05 (Rev. 2007)

f) Separability. Every section, provision, or part of this property maintenance code is declared
separable from every other section, provision, or part to the extent that if any section,
provision, or part of this property maintenance code shall be held invalid by a court of law, it
shall not invalidate any other section, provision, or part thereof,

425.05. Adoption of international property maintenance code by reference. Subdivision 1. Code
adopted. The International Property Maintenance Code, 2006 edition, as published by the International
Code Council and as it may be amended, is adopted as the property maintenance code of the city, for the
control of buildings, structures and property as provided in this section, and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of such code are referred to, adopted and made a
part of this section as if fully set out in this section, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes
as set forth in section 425.05, subdivision 2 “Revisions” of this code.

Subd. 2. Revisions. The following sections of the International Property Maintenance Code,
2006 edition, are revised as follows:

a) Section 101.1. Title. Amendg{c'l}to read: These regulations shall be known as the property
maintenance code of the city of nystal, hereinafter referred to as property maintenance code.

b) Section 102.3. Application dflif-%)the.rf:fébdes. Amended to read: Repairs, additions or
alterations to a structure of changes ‘-of occupancy shall be done in accordance with the
procedures and provisions of the Minnesota State Building Code and the Crystal city code.

c) Section 102.7. Referenced codés and‘étandards. Amended to read: All references to other
codes or standards within this property maintenance code shall mean the applicable provision
of the Crystal city code or Minnesota State Building Code, whichever is the most restrictive
requirement permitted under statute.

d) Section 103.2. Appointment. Delete entire section and amend to read: The city manager or
the manager’s designee shall be the code official responsible for the administration and
enforcement of this code.

e) Section 103.5. Fees. Amended to read: The fees for activities and services performed by
the city in carrying out its responsibilities under this code are established in appendix IV, as
amended from time to time.

f) Section 111. Means of appeal. Délete egjife section and amend to read:
1) Appeals. Appeals of ct‘)rer‘ectioni’%r, compliance orders issued by the city pursuant to

the property maintenang@ code are governed by and subject to the provisions of
section 306 of the Crystal tity code.




Crystal City Code

2)

3

4)

425.05, Subd. 2 g)
(Rev. 2008)

Penalties. Any person who fails to comply with a correction or compliance order
after right of appeal has expired, and any person who fails to comply with a modified
correction or compliance order within the time set therein, and any person who
violated any of the provisions of this property maintenance code by doing any act or
omitting to do any act that constitutes a breach of any section shall be subject to
administrative citations -and cml “penalties contained in sections 306.07 through
306.17 of the city code. e

Alternative sanctions. In-the case of commercial facilities and rental dwellings that
require licensing, said”'licensin.g. may be revoked or renewal withheld until
compliance with this preperty maintenance code in accordance with licensing
provisions contained in section 1005 21 of the city code.

Execution of correction o'r compllance order by public authority. Upon failure to
comply with a correction or compliance order within the time set therein and no
appeal having been taken, or upon failure to comply with a modified correction or
compliance order within the time set therein, the city may cause the cited deficiency
to be remedied as set forth in section 306 of the city code.

g) Section 202. General definitions. Amended by adding:

1)

2)

“Occupied” for dwelling units means occupied areas will include those areas
designated and utilized as habitable space, as well as non-habitable spaces that are
easily accessible and normally utilized by the occupants. For nonresidential facilities,
occupied areas will include all areas utilized in the operation of whatever use
occupies the building. :

“Unsanitary” as applied tb a stru¢ture means failure to maintain healthy conditions
and liable to be a danger or hazard to the health of persons occupying or frequenting
it, or to the public, if> such: &anger arises from the methods or materials of
construction, or from equ1pment installed therein for the purposes of lighting,
heating, ventilation, or: plumbmg, or from existing conditions liable to cause rat
infestation, vermin mfestatlon accumulatlon of trash or debris in the building, yards
or accessory structure on the . premlses or from mold-causing conditions. Same as
unsanitary. ’ :

h) Section 302. Exterior Property Areas. Amended by adding an amended Section 302.3, and
adding Sections 302.10, 302.11 and 302.12, to read: (Amended, Ord. 2008-08)




Crystal City Code

1

2)

3

4)

425.05, Subd. 2 h) 1)
(Rev. 2008)

Section 302.3. Sidewalks and driveways. All sidewalks, walkways, stairs, driveways,
parking spaces and similar areas shall be kept in a proper state of repair, and maintained
free from hazardous conditions. All driveways and lawful auxiliary spaces shall be
hard-surfaced with bituminous or concrete pavement in accordance with standards
approved by the city engineer. Alternative hard-surfacing such as pavers may be
approved on a case-by-case basis by the city engineer upon a determination that the
standards of Crystal City Code Section 515.17, Subd. 4 g) 8) can be met. Any non-
hard-surfaced driveways existing at the time of inspection, whether for the purposes of a
Certificate of Compliance or rental license, shall be hard-surfaced within 180 days of
issuance of a Certificate of Compliance for point of sale inspections or within 180 days
of issuance of a rental Iicense, whether new or renewal. (Added, Ord. 2008-08)

Section 302.10. Removal of srow and ice. The owner of an apartment or
commercial building shall be respon31ble for the removal of snow and ice from
parking lots, driveways, steps arid walkways on the premises within 24 hours of the
cessation of the snowfall causing the accumulation. (Amended, Ord. 2008-08)

Section 302.11. Illumination. The owner of a multiple occupancy building shall be
responsible for providing and maihtaining illumination in all exterior parking lots and
walkways with provisions to.control glare affecting surrounding properties.
(Amended, Ord. 2008-08) '

Section 302.12. Landscamn;z in vards and setbacks. The owner of any building shall
be responsible for providing and maintaining landscaping in all yards and/or setbacks
and all areas not designated for buildings, circulation, parking or storage on the
premises. (Amended, Ord. 2008-08)

i) Section 304.13. Window, sl_cyhght and doorframes. Amended by adding section 304.13.3.
Storm windows.

1

Section 304.13.3. Storm windows. All operable windows with a single layer of glass
must be provided with tight fitting storm windows. Storm windows may be
temporarily removed to allow for the installation of screens during periods of warm
weather. : U

j) Section 304.15. Doors. Amended'_by_adﬁfhg section 304.15.1. Apartment security system.




Crystal City Code ' : 425.05, Subd. 2j) 1)

L9}

)

0)

p)

Q)

B (Rev. 2008)

1) Section 304.15.1. Apartment securltv system. For the purpose of providing a
reasonable amount of safety and general welfare for persons occupying apartment
dwellings, an approved ,s.ecurltyl system shall be maintained for each apartment
building to control accéss. The : ‘security system shall consist of locked building
entrance or foyer doors and “lock doors leading from hallways into individual
dwelling units. Dead-latch type door locks shall be provided with lever knobs (or
doorknobs) on the inside of the bujlding entrance doors and with key cylinders on the
outside of building entrance doors. Building entrance door latches shall be of a type
that is permanently locked from ‘the outside and permanently unlocked from the
inside. :

Section 402. Light. Amended by adding Section 402.4. Convenience switches, to read:
Section 402.4. Convenience switches. A convenience switch or equivalent device for
turning on a light in each dwelling unit shall be located near the points of entrance to such
unit,

Section 404.5 Overcrowding. Amended to read as follows: In order to prevent conditions
that endanger the life, health, safety or welfare of the occupants, no dwelling unit shall be
permitted to be overcrowded. A dwelling unit shall be considered overcrowded if there are
more residents than one plus one additional resident for every 150 square feet of gross floor
area of finished space in the dwelling unit.

Section 505.1. General. Delete all ireﬁegences to the “International Plumbing Code” and
replace with “Minnesota State Building C,éde.”

Section 602.2. Res1dent1a1 occunanmes Delete the reference to Appendix D of the
“International Plumbing Code” and replace with “Minnesota State Building Code.” Also,
delete 65° F (18° C) and replace w1th 68° F {20°C).

Section 602.3. Heat supply. Insert Sep’[ember 1 to June 1 and delete 65° F (18° C) and
replace with 68° F (20° C). Delete the reference to Appendix D of the “International
Plumbing Code” and replace with “Minnesota State Building Code.”

Section 602.4. Occupiable workspace. Insert: September 1 to June 1 and delete 65° F (18°
C) and replace with 68° F (20° C).

Section 604.2. Service. Delete the reference to the “ICC Electrical Code” and replace with
“Minnesota State Building Code.”

Section 702. Means of egress. Delete all references to the “International Building Code” and
replace with “Minnesota State Building Code.”




Crystal City Code o 425.05, Subd. 2 s)
: ' (Rev. 2008)

s) Chapter 8. Referenced standards. Amended to read: All references to other code standards
within this code shall mean the applicable provision of Crystal city code or Minnesota State
Building code, whichever is the most restrictive requirement permitted under statute.

Subd. 3. Copy on file. One copy of the International Property Maintenance Code, together with
a copy of this code, each marked "official copy", must be kept on file in the office of the city clerk and
available for public inspection. The clerk and the building official must keep a reasonable number of
additional copies of the International Property Mamtenance Code and this code available for use and
inspection by the public at reasonable times.
425.07. Definitions. Subdivision 1. General. For purposes of this code, the terms defined in this section
have the meanings given them. : ﬁ

a) “Apartment” means a commumty, complex or building having a common owner and
containing four or more living units. i




Crystal City Code g 425.07, Subd. 1 b)

b)

c)

d)

g)

h)

i)

0

D

(Rev. 2007)

“Certificate of compliance” means a docnment issued by the city, stating that the building has
been inspected and complies with applicable property maintenance codes and ordinances.

“Code" or "this code" means thé‘ properfy maintenance code; "city code" means the Crystal
city code of ordinances; "building code”-means chapter IV of the city code; "zoning code"
means the city code, appendix I, section'515.

“Common areas" means halls, corridors, passageways, utility rooms, recreational rooms and
extensive landscaped areas, not under the exclusive control of one person or family, in or
adjacent to an apartment dwelling.

“Dwelling" means a building or a poition of a building designed for residential occupancy:
the term includes single-family, two-family, three-family and apartment dwellings but does
not include hotels, motels, nursing homes and boarding houses.

“Dwelling unit" means (i) a single-famil:)'l dwelling or (ii) a discrete portion of a dwelling
designed for occupancy by one family.

“General housing unit” means a dwellm_g unit other than an apartment, including but not
limited to those within a townhouse condommlum double bungalow, single-family, two-
family or three-family bu11dmg ’ L

“Gross floor area” means the snin of the' gross horizontal areas of the several floors of such
building or buildings measured from the exterior or from the centerline of party walls
separating two buildings. Basements f‘d,efvoted to storage and space devoted to off-street
parking shall not be included. - ‘

“Housing official" means the city “officer or officers in the community development

department and other city departments de51gnated by the city manager to administer this
code. ,

“Let for Occupancy” or “To Let” means to permit possession or occupancy of a dwelling or
living unit by a person who is not the legal owner of record thereof, pursuant to a written or
unwritten lease, or pursuant to a recorded or unrecorded agreement whether or not a fee is
required by the agreement.

“Living unit” means a single unit providing complete, independent living facilities for one or
more persons including permanent prowsmns for living, sleeping, eating, cooking and
sanitation, :

“Nonresident owner” means an owner who does not reside in any of the following Minnesota
counties: Hennepin, Ramsey, Anoka Carver Dakota, Scott, or Washington.




Crystal City Code - 425.07, Subd. 1 m)
(Rev. 2007)

m) “Occupant” means any person living or sleeping in a dwelling; or having possession of a
space within a dwelling.

n) “Owner", means any person, firm or corporation who alone or jointly or severally with others
is in actual possession of a dwelling or dwelling unit in the city as owner.

0) “Rent” means to let for occupancy-or to let

p) “Rental dwelling” means any apartment. or general housing unit let for occupancy, or any
apartment or general housing unit occupled by someone other than the owner of record
regardless of familial relatlonshlp or whether rent or other compensation is paid to the owner.

q) “Repair" means to restore to a sound acceptable state of operation, serviceability or
appeararnce. :

r) “Replace" means to remove an existing item or portion of a system and to construct or install
a new item of similar or new quahty as an existing item when repair of the item is
impractical. :

s) “Resident agent” means an authorized representative of a nonresident owner who resides in
either Hennepin, Ramsey, Anoka, Carver, Dakota, Scott, or Washington.

Subd. 2. Code official. The term “code official” where the term is used in the International
Property Maintenance Code means the city manager.

Subd. 3. Relation to other code deﬁnmons Except as expressly provided in this code, words,
terms, and phrases used in this code have the meamngs given them by the city code. In cases where
conflicting definitions of a word, term, or phrase. make its precise meaning unclear in its application to
particular facts, the city manager is authonzed to fesolve the conflict subject to the provisions of
subsection 425.27 relating to appeals.

425.09. Application. Subdivision 1. Gener‘ai Thi"é:':"c'ode applies to buildings, their premises, accessory
structures thereto, and dwelling units therein or thereon used or designed to be used for human
habitation.

Subd. 2. Existing buildings. A building ldeully existing under the building code must conform
to this code. A building need not be altered of changed to exceed the requirements of the building code in
effect at the time of its construction, except in the following cases:

a) Ifthe building is altered er enlarged pursuant to the building code;

b) If the building is moved or relocated; or




Crystal City Code SRETR 425.11 (Rev. 2007)

c¢) If the building is determined to be unséféj'or hazardous by the building inspector pursuant to
applicable codes and ordinances.

Occupancy in buildings lawfully existing under the b’uilding code may be continued under this code.

425.11. Duties of owners and occupants. - Subdivision 1. Sanitation. The occupant of a general housing
unit must maintain in a clean and sanitary condition that part of the unit and yard that the occupant
occupies and controls; and is responsible for the occupant's own misuse of areas and facilities available in
common. The owner of an apartment must maintain in a clean and sanitary condition the shared or public
areas of the apartment and yard. The occupant of a general housing unit or apartment must keep all
supplied facilities, including plumbing fixtures and cooking equipment, in a clean and sanitary condition
and is responsible for the exercise of reasonable care in their proper use and operation.

Subd. 2. Removal of waste matter and recyclable materials. The occupant of a general housing
unit must dispose of rubbish, ashes, garbage and other organic waste in a clean and sanitary manner as
provided by section 605 of the city code. The owner.of an apartment is responsible for the clean and
sanitary maintenance of common storage or:disposal fafcilities and must dispose of rubbish in a clean and
sanitary manner as provided in section 605 of the Clty :code. The owner of an apartment containing more
than eight units must comply with the requlrements of subsectlon 650.19 of the city code.

Subd. 3. Pest extermination. The occup'a'p';” of a single dwelling unit is responsible for the
extermination of vermin infestations or rodents on the premises. The occupant of a dwelling unit in a
building containing more than one dwelling unit is responsible for such extermination when the dwelling
unit is infested. When infestation is caused by the fa’il}ire of the owner or occupant to maintain a building
containing dwelling units in a reasonably rodent-resistant or reasonably vermin-resistant condition, pest
extermination is the responsibility of the owner. Afto‘f' ‘extermination, it is the responsibility of the owner
or occupant, as the case may be, to correct such ‘maintenance or other problems as designated by
appropriate city officials to eliminate the source of the infestation. If infestation exists in two or more
dwelling units in any residential structure, or in the shared or public parts of any residential structure
containing two or more dwelling units, pest extermination is the responsibility of the owner.

Subd. 4. Heat. The owner of a building containing two or more dwelling units must supply
facilities capable of providing adequate heat to every habitable room therein; for the purposes of this
subdivision "adequate heat" means heat sufficient to maintain a temperature of 68° F (20° C) at a height of
three feet above the floor in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and water closet compartments.

Subd. 5. Utilities. Except as otherwise proy}ded by law, an owner or occupant may not cause
service equipment or utility service that is required. by this code to be removed, shut off or discontinued
for any occupied dwelling let or occupied by that person except for such temporary interruption as may
be necessary while actual repairs or alteratlons are in process or during temporary emergencies.




Crystal City Code | 425.11, Subd. 6
(Rev. 2007)

Subd. 6. Notice of maximum occupancy. An owner must advise the occupant, in writing, by
insertion in the lease between the parties or otherwise, of the maximum number of occupants permitted in
occupied premises subject to this code.

425.13. Sale of property: certificate of compllanceg Subdivision 1. Application. The owner of a
structure containing one or two dwelling units must, prlor to the execution of a document providing for
the conveyance of the structure, furnish to the prospectnve buyer thereof, and obtain from the buyer a
signed receipt therefore, a copy of a certificate of cop}pllance issued by the housing official within one
year preceding the date of the execution of the docume\i:jt of conveyance.

Subd. 2. Form of certificate. The housing official must issue a housing maintenance inspection
compliance report (hereinafter “inspection report™) to 'fbe owner within 15 days after gaining access to the
interior of all structures on the subject property for the purposes of inspection when:

a) The owner or the owner's authorized agent has applied in writing to the housing official,
giving consent to such inspection, and thé. owner or agent has agreed to a time during normal
city working hours at which the subject property will be available for inspection, and has paid
the inspection fee set forth in appendix I'V; and

b) The housing official has inspected the structure and grounds and has noted in the inspection
report any conditions found during the inspection that are in violation of the city code.

Subd. 3. Responsibility. The owner is responisible for the corrections required in the inspection
report. )

Subd. 4. Certificate of compliance. The selléf of a single- or two-family dwelling may receive a
certificate of compliance upon satisfactory completlo' -of the corrective actions required in the inspection
report. "

Subd. 5. Alternative procedure; buyer’s agreement As an alternative to subdivision 3, the owner
of a single- or two-family dwelling may receive a certlﬁcate of compliance if the following steps are
completed: :

a) Owner provides a prospective buyer with a “Buyer’s Agreement to Comply with Housing
Maintenance Code” (hereinafter “buyer’s-agreement”) on a form provided by the city setting
forth those conditions in the building which, if not corrected, will constitute a major structural
defect or an immediate danger to the health and safety of the occupant or, which if not
corrected, will constitute a violation of this code. In such a case, the buyer’s agreement
acknowledges that the buyer is presumed to have purchased with notice of such condition and
is responsible for the corrective action required by a compliance order.

b) Buyer executes the buyer’s agreement and files it with the city.




Crystal City Code - 425.13, Subd. 6
(Rev. 2007)

Subd. 6. Occupancy. A prospective buyer may not occupy a dwelling unit that is the subject of a
compliance order until the filing has been made. If the owner or buyer files a buyer’s agreement with the
city setting forth the date by which the Corrective action directed by the compliance order will be
completed, occupancy is permitted pending completion of the corrective action specified in the
compliance order unless the dwelling unit has been declared unfit for human habitation pursuant to
subsection 425.25. :

Subd. 7. Effect of certificate or statement. Nothing in the certificate of compliance or the buyer’s
agreement described in subdivision 5 is to be construed as a representation by the city or the housing
official that the dwelling meets minimum housing and building standards of the city.

2

Subd. 8. Prohibition. It is unlawful for an.owner to convey a dwelling without first having
received a certificate of compliance from the clty as requlred by this section. This section does not apply
to conveyances to a public body, conveyances by a: pubhc or court officer in the performance of the
officer's duties, or conveyances by a person actmg under the direction of court order, except for
conveyances ordered by a probate court. ' -

425.15. Administration, enforcement; insgecﬁo Subdivision 1. Administration and enforcement. The
city manager is responsible for the admmlstratlon and: £nforcement of this code and the supervision of the
housing official. : ;

Subd. 2. Compliance. When the housing official determines that there exists in a building or a
portion thereof conditions that constitute a violation of this code, the housing official may begin
enforcement procedures set forth in section 306 of the Crystal city code.

425.17. Licensing of rental units. Subdivision 1. General rule. It is unlawful to operate a rental dwelling
without first having obtained a license. The license is issued each year and expires on the anniversary date
of issuance.

N

Subd. 2. Application. This subsec’uon establishes minimum standards for maintaining rental
properties; i.e., general housing units, apaﬁments dwellmgs dwelling units, accessory structures and
related premises. A building and its premises’ used i in: ‘whole or in part as a home or residence, or as an
accessory structure thereto, for a single famILy or person and a building used in whole or in part as a
home or residence of two or more persons,or famlhes living in separate units must conform to the
requirements of this section without regard to when' the building may have been constructed, altered, or
repaired. This subsection is intended to prov1de standards for licensed rental housing and to provide
standards to allow resolution of complaints- regardmg licensed rental housing.




Crystal City Code 425.17, Subd. 3
- (Rev. 2007)

Subd. 3. License fees. For license_fenewals,.license fees are due no later than 60 days prior to
the license expiration date. If an application, for license renewal is made less than 60 days before the
beginning date of the license period applied for then the fee shall be accompanied by an additional
amount equal to 100 percent of such license fee. The additional amount shall be a penalty for a late
application. For general housing units or apartmerits intended for rental for which a license was not issued

for the previous year, license fees must accompany the completed license application. License fees are set
in appendix IV. ‘

Subd. 4. Conditions. A license is nontransferable. The license fee is not refundable upon
revocation or suspension, '

Subd. 5. Application; information. Applications for a license or renewal of a license must be
made by the owner of a rental dwelling. Apphca‘uon forms are filed with the city, accompanied by the
applicable fee. The applicant must provide:

a) Name, street address (a post office box number is not acceptable), and telephone number of
dwelling owner, owning partners if a partnership, corporate officers if a corporation;

b) Name, address and telephone number of designated resident agent, if any;

¢) Name, address and telephone number of vendee if the rental dwelling is being sold through a
contract for deed; 3

d) Legal address of the rental dwelling;
e) Number of rental dwelling units within th,ez'-structure; and
f) Description of procedure by which tennn’t‘fi‘nquiries and complaints are handled by the owner,

g) For properties with multiple owners, the names, street addresses and telephone numbers of all
owners, one of whom must be designated as the primary contact.

Subd. 6. Notice of change. The licensee shall give notice in writing to the city within five
business days after any change of the information in the application. Notice of transfer of ownership is
governed by subdivision 12 of this section. °

Subd. 7. Resident agent required. An operating license will not be issued or renewed for a
nonresident owner of rental dwellings unless the owner designates in writing the name of a resident agent
who is responsible for maintenance and upkeep and to institute remedial action to effect remediation of
such orders on behalf of the owner. The housmg ofﬁmal must be notlﬁed in writing by the owner of a
change of resident agent.




Crystal City Code . 425.17, Subd. 8
. (Rev. 2007)

Subd. 8. Conformance to laws. A license will not be issued or renewed unless the rental
dwelling and its premises conform to this section, the ordinances of the city and the laws of the state of
Minnesota.

Subd. 9. Inspection condition. A license will not be issued or renewed unless the owner of the
rental dwelling agrees in the application to permit inspéctions pursuant to subdivision 18.

Subd. 10. Issuance of license followm,q msoectlon A rental license shall be issued in instances
where no compliance orders are identified by ‘the housmg official for a rental dwelling unit. A conditional
rental license shall be issued in instances where comphance orders have been identified and a copy of the
orders provided to the owner. The owner of the property for which a conditional license is issued shall
have a maximum of 60 days from the date of the mspectlon to make the necessary corrections and request
reinspection for compliance. The conditional license’may be revoked automatically by the city if the
compliance orders have not been completed and verlﬁed as such by a reinspection within 60 days of the
date of the initial inspection.

Subd. 11. Posting of license. The hcensee of a building containing three or more rental dwellings
must post the current license in a conspicucus Iocatlon in the main entry in a frame with a glass or plastic
cover. Every owner of a single-family or two-famlly rental dwelling must post the license issued by the
city in a conspicuous location.

Subd. 12. Transfer. The licensee must give notice in writing to the housing official within five
business days after having legally transferred or otherwise disposed of the effective control of licensed
rental dwelling. The notice must include the name and address of the person succeeding to the ownership
or control of the rental dwelling or dwellings. For purppses of this subsection the term "effective control"
means that control exercised over property by a busmess proprietor, whether as owner or lessee or by an
owner or lessee of other property. N

Subd. 13. Occupancy register required. The.owner of a licensed rental dwelling containing one
or more dwelling units must keep a current register of occupancy for each dwelling unit. The register
must be available for viewing or copying by the housmg official at reasonable times and at the scheduled
time of the annual inspection. The register must prov1dé the following information:

a) Dwelling unit address;
b) Number of bedrooms in dwellin,g' unit;

¢) Names of adult occupants and humbéf,:’jbf adults and children (under 18 years of age)
currently occupying the dwelling units; |

d) Dates renters occupied and vacated dweflfng units;



Crystal City Code 425.17, Subd. 14
L (Rev. 2007)

e) A chronological list of complaints and feqiiests for repair by dwelling unit occupants, which
complaints and requests are relatod to the provisions of this section; and

f) A similar chronological list of corrections made in response to requests and complaints.

Subd. 14. License suspension or revocation. An operating license is subject to suspension,
denial, or revocation by the council if the licensed owner fails to operate or maintain licensed rental
dwellings and units therein consistent with this section and the law. If an operating license is suspended
or revoked by the council in accordance with section 1005.21 through 1005.23 of the city code, it shall be
unlawful for the owner to permit occupancy of a rental dwelling until a valid operating license is issued
by the council. Issuance of a new license after suspension, denial or revocation shall be made in the
manner set forth in this section, but only after the housing official determines that the applicant/owner has
remedied the conditions identified by the city council as the basis for its action, and only after the
applicant/owner has appeared before the city council to formally request approval of the license
application. The license application must be accompanied by all fees required by this section.

Subd. 15. License expiration or non-renewal. If a rental license expires and/or is not renewed, it
shall be unlawful for the owner or owner’s agent to'tliéreafter permit the occupancy of the then vacant, or
thereafter vacated, rental dwelling until such time as'a valid rental license is obtained. In instances where
the rental dwelling is occupied beyond the hcense ‘expiration date and application for a license is
subsequently submitted to the city, the apphcation fee shall be doubled.

Subd. 16. Posted to prevent occupahcy. .Whenever a rental dwelling is occupied without having
first been issued a rental license, or any initial or renewal application for a rental license has been denied,
or a rental license has been revoked, suspended, or.nof[ renewed, the rental dwelling shall be posted by the
housing official to prevent further occupancy. No person other than the housing official shall remove or
alter any posting. The housing official will post-the’date the rental dwelling shall be vacated, and no
person shall reside in, occupy or cause to ‘be occupled that rental dwelling until the housing official
permits it. :

Subd. 17. Enforcement; inspection authority. The housing official administers and enforces the
provisions of this subsection. The housing official may inspect upon receiving a complaint, change in
ownership, or otherwise when reason exists to believe that a violation of this subsection has been or is
being committed. If the city finds that the circumstanegs of the occupancy following the issuance of the
license involve possible code violations, substandard_,’finaintenance, or abnormal wear and tear, the city
may re-inspect the premises during the licensing. period. The housing official may seek warrants
authorizing the inspection of property. Inspections miist be conducted during reasonable daylight hours.
The housing official must present evidence of ofﬁc:ial authority to the occupant in charge of a licensed
rental dwelling. i




Crystal City Code 425.17, Subd. 18
' (Rev. 2007)

Subd. 18. [Inspection access. If an owner, ‘occupant, or other person in charge of a rental
dwelling licensed under this section fails or refuses. to permit free access and entry for inspection
purposes, the housing official may, upon a. showmg of probable cause, obtain orders from a court of
competent jurisdiction for the inspection.

425.19. Minimum requirements; lmplementatlon standards, policies. Subdivision 1. Minimum
requirements. The minimum requirements imposéd by this code include (i) those standards or

requirements in effect on the date of the constructio of a building subject to this code; (ii) the 2006
International Property Maintenance Code as amended and (iii) imminent hazards including but not
limited to: :

a) Heating systems that are unsafe due tor biirned out or rusted out heat exchangers (fire box);
burned out or plugged flues; not being_’vented; being connected with unsafe gas supplies; or
being incapable of adequately heating the living space;

b) Water heaters that are unsafe due to: bdrided out or rusted out heat exchangers (fire box);
burned out, rusted out, or plugged flues; not being vented; being connected with unsafe gas
supplies; or lack of temperature and pressure relief valves;

c¢) Electrical systems that are unsafe due to: dangerous overloading; damaged or deteriorated
equipment; improperly tapped or spliced wiring; exposed, uninsulated wires; distribution
systems of extension cords or other temporary methods; ungrounded systems; ungrounded
appliances in contact with earth;

d) Plumbing systems that are unsamtary due t'o leaking waste systems fixtures and traps; lack of
a water closet; lack of washing -and bathmg facilities; or cross connection of pure water

supply with fixtures or sewage lings;

e) Structural systems, walls, chlmneys celhngs roofs, foundations, and floor systems, that will
not safely carry imposed loads; ' :

f) Refuse, garbage, human waste,‘decayiné*y,ermin or other dead animals, animal waste, other
materials rendering it unsanitary for humaif occupancy, including lack of light and air;

g) Infestation of rats, insects, and other vermin.
Subd. 2. Implementation policies. The city council, upon recommendation of the city manager,
will adopt by resolution policies and guidelines for the implementation and administration of this code.

These policies and guidelines must include, but are not limited to, standards and guidelines relating to:

a) Procedures for housing inspections;




Crystal City Code P 425.19, Subd. 2 b)

b)

c)

d)

e)

(Rev. 2007)
Proper disposition of information éatherca in connection with housing inspections;
Conditional occupancy of hcusing during periods needed for compliance;

Methods of encouraging the correction of deficiencies by cooperation between owner and
proposed and current occupants,

Ongoing training and education for owners of rental dwellings and city housing official.

425.21. Conduct on licensed premises. Subdivision 1. It is the responsibility of the licensee to see that
persons occupying the licensed premises conduct thgmselves in such a manner as not to cause the
premises to be disorderly. For purposes of this sectlon a premise is disorderly at which any of the
following activities occur; :

a)
b)

c)

d

g)

h)

Violation of sections 2010 (public nuisancgs) and 605 (garbage and refuse) of this code,

Violation of section 645 of this code (nci ;_;j;control).

Violation of section 910 of this code (dog ;:(..:‘ontrol, animals).

Violation of section 930 of this code (drljé abuse and control) or violation of laws relating to
the possession of controlled substances.as defined in Minnesota Statutes, section 152.01 et
seq. .

Violation of subsection 2005.01 of '[hlS code (disorderly conduct) or violation of laws relating
to disorderly conduct as defined in anesota Statutes, section 609.72.

Violation of chapter XII of this code (sale, consumption and display of liquor and beer) or
violation of laws relating to the sale of intoxicating liquor as defined in Minnesota Statutes,
sections 340A.701, 340A.702 or 340A.703.

Violation of laws relating to pros'tituti_éh or acts relating to prostitution as defined in
Minnesota Statutes, section 609.321, subdivision 9.

Violation of sections 935 (gun control) and 945 (use of ﬁrearms) of this code or violation of
laws relating to unlawful use or. possessxon of a firearm as defined in Minnesota Statutes,
section 609.66 et seq., on the llccnsed prcmlses.

Violations of laws relating to assault,'_‘t;ut not including domestic assault as defined in
Minnesota Statutes, section 609.2242. =

T,




Crystal City Code 425.21, Subd. 2
(Rev. 2007)

j) Violation of laws relating to contributingﬂtc; the need for protection or services or delinquency
of a minor as defined in Minnesota Statutes, section 260C, et. seq.

Subd. 2. The city manager or designee is resb'onsible for enforcement and administration of this
section. =

Subd. 3. First notice. Upon determmatlon by the city manager that a licensed premise was used
in a disorderly manner, as described in subdmsmn 1. of this section, the city manager must give notice to .
the licensee of the violation and direct the licensee to take steps to prevent further violations.

Subd. 4. Second notice. If anbthér instancé" of disorderly use of the licensed premises occurs
within three months of an incident for which a notice in subdivision 3 of this section was given, the city
manager must notify the licensee of the violation and must also require the licensee to submit a written
report of the actions taken, and proposed to be taken, by the licensee to prevent further disorderly use of
the premises. This written report must be submitted to the city manager within five days of receipt of the
notice of disorderly use of the premises and must detail all actions taken by the licensee in response to all
notices of disorderly use of the premises within the preceding three months.

Subd. 5. Third notice. If another instance of disorderly use of the licensed premises occurs
within three months after any two previous instances of disorderly use for which notices were given to the
licensee pursuant to this section, the rental dwelling. Ilcense for the premises may be denied, revoked,
suspended or not renewed. . ;=

a) An action to deny, revoke, suspend, or notTenew a license under this section must be initiated

by the city manager who must give to the licensee written notice of a hearing before the city
council to consider such denial, revocatlon suspension or non-renewal. Such written notice
must specify all violations of this section,-and must state the date, time, place and purpose of
the hearing. The hearing must be held no less than ten days and no more than 30 days after
giving such notice. - i

b) Following the hearing, the city council ‘r"nay deny, revoke, suspend or decline to renew the
license for all or any part or parts of the licensed premises or may grant a license upon such
terms and conditions as it deems necessary to accomplish the purposes of this section.

Subd. 6. No adverse license action shall be iinposed where the instance of disorderly use of the
licensed premises occurred during the pendency of eviction proceedings (unlawful detainer) or within 30
days of notice given by the licensee to a tenant to vacate the premises where the disorderly use was
related to conduct by that tenant or by other occupants or guests of the tenant's unit. Eviction proceedings
arenot a bar to adverse license action, however, unless they are diligently pursued by the
licensee. Further, an action to deny, revoke, suspend, or not renew a license based upon violations of this
section may be postponed or discontinued at any time if it appears that the licensee has taken appropriate
measures which will prevent further instances of disorderly use.




Crystal City Code 425.21, Subd. 7

(Rev. 2007) -

Subd. 7. A determination that the licensed premises have been used in a disorderly manner as
described in section 425.21, subdivision 1 of this section shall be made upon a fair preponderance of the
evidence to support such a determination. It is not necessary that criminal charges be brought in order to
support a determination of disorderly use nor does the fact of dismissal or acquittal of such a criminal
charge operate as a bar to adverse license action under this section.

Subd. 8. All notices given by the city under this section must be personally served on the
licensee, sent by certified mail to the licensee's last known address or, if neither method of service effects
notice, by posting on a conspicuous place on the licensed premises.

. 7

Subd. 9. Enforcement actions provided in this"‘section are not exclusive, and the city council may
take any action with respect to a licensee, a tenant, or‘the licensed premises as is authorized by the city
code, state or federal law. ' 3

425.23. Reporting; forms; records. The Crystal comf_ﬁunity development department is responsible for
the preparation of forms and certificates necessary;to carry out the provisions of this code. The
community development department will mamtam records of rental licensing and will provide reports to
the city manager upon request. ' ’

425.25. Hazardous conditions; built-in deﬁciencies;: procedure. Subdivision 1. Procedure. If the
housing official determines that there exists in a building a condition that constitutes an immediate hazard
to the health and safety of its occupants, including but not limited to those identified in section 425.19,
subdivision 1, the official may: :
a) Issue a compliance order requiring 1mmed1ate compliance if the condition can reasonably be
corrected;

b) Proceed against the building pursuant to appllcable state laws relating to hazardous or unsafe
structures; or .

¢) Recommend that the city council proceed to correct the condition by abating it as a nuisance
under Minnesota Statutes, section 429.'1‘,0‘1:, and this clause is to be construed as authorizing
the imposition and billing of charges for the cost thereof and the assessment of unpaid
charges against the property on whlch the building is located in the manner provided by
Minnesota Statutes, section 429 101.

Subd. 2. Built-in deficiencies. It is détermihéd that certain conditions within existing buildings,
lawful at the time of the construction of the building, may not comply with the minimum requirements of
this code. Such conditions are herein referred to as. "bullt in deficiencies", and the housing official, in
administering this code, must consider the followmg built-in deficiencies as being beyond reasonable
correction: N




Crystal City Code I 425.25, Subd. 2 a)
R (Rev. 2007)

o 1
. ." .

a) Ceiling heights: An existing :ha'bitable;'rbom with less than a seven foot six inch ceiling
height. ' S

b) Superficial floor area: An existing habitaﬁie room of less than 90 square feet.

¢) Natural light and ventilation: An existiné-'habitable room with window area less than 10% of
the floor area; provided, however, thaf. in no case may the required area of light and
ventilation be less than 5% of the ﬂoor ar.ea.

425.27. Inspections. Subdivision 1. Records. Inspectlons must be conducted during reasonable hours.
The housing official must present evidence of authority to the owner or occupant in charge of a dwelling.
Subject to the provisions of law, the housing official must keep evidence, exclusive of the inspection
records, discovered or obtained in the course of an inspection confidential.

Subd. 2. Unfit for human habitation. A dwelling or portion thereof that is damaged, decayed,
dilapidated, unsanitary, unsafe, vermin or rodent infested or which lacks provision for basic illumination,
ventilation or sanitary facilities to the extent that the defects create a hazard to the health, safety or
welfare of the occupants or of the public may be declared unfit for human habitation. If a dwelling or
portion thereof has been declared unfit for human habltatlon the housing official must order the dwelling
vacated within a reasonable time and post a placard on the dwelling indicating that it is unfit for human
habitation. No person other than the housing ofﬁc;ql shall remove or alter any posting. The housing
official will post the date the dwelling shall 'be vacated, and no person shall reside in, occupy or cause to
be occupied that rental dwelling until the housing ¢fficial permits it. An operating license previously
issued for the dwelling will be revoked pursuant to layw,

Subd. 3. Correction. It is unlawful to use a dei"'elling or portion thereof for human habitation until
the defective conditions have been corrected and writggh approval has been issued by the housing official.
It is unlawful to deface or remove the declaration plapard from a dwelling or property.

Subd. 4. Secure unfit and vacated dwelliﬁgér" The owner of a dwelling that has been declared
unfit for human habitation or that is otherwise vacant for a period of 60 days or more must make the same
safe and secure so that it is not hazardous to the health, safety and welfare of the public and does not
constitute a public nuisance. A vacant dwelling open at doors, windows, or wall opening, if unguarded, is
deemed a hazard to the health, safety and welfare of the public and a public nuisance within the meaning
of this section.

Subd. 5. Hazardous building declaration. If a dwelling has been declared unfit for human
habitation and the owner has not remedied the defects, within a prescribed reasonable time, the dwelling
may be declared a hazardous building and may be rem()ved razed or corrected pursuant to the provisions
of Minnesota Statutes, sections 463.15 to 463.26. .




Crystal City Code R 425.27, Subd. 6

Subd. 6. Compliance procedure. Subdivision'l. Order. If the city determines that a structure or
dwelling or portion thereof is in violation of an erder or this code, the city may issue & compliance orders
in accordance with section 306 of city code.

425.29. Appeals; right of appeal. When it is alleged by a person to whom a compliance order is directed
that the compliance order is based upon erroneous interpretation of this section or upon a misstatement or
mistake of fact, that person may appeal the compliance order to the city manager. The manager must
forward the recommendation to the city council w1th1n -30 days after receipt of this appeal. The appeal (i)
must be in writing, (ii) must specify the grounds for- the appeal, and (iii) must be filed with the housing
official within five business days after service of the compliance order. The filing of an appeal stays
proceedings in furtherance of the action appealed from unless such a stay in the judgment of the housing
official would cause imminent peril to life, health or property The city council must act promptly on the
manager's recommendation and the manager's recomme_mdatlon may be reversed, modified or affirmed in
whole or in part by the council. The council's disposiﬁ'éh of the appeal is final.

425.31. Execution of compliance orders. Upon faxlure to comply with a compliance order within the
time set therein, and no appeal having been taken in' ‘accordance with section 306 of city code, or upon
failure to comply with a modified compliance order wlthm the time set therein, the city may remedy the
cited deficiency in the manner provided for in section 306 of city code.

425.33. Violations; penalties. Subdivision 1. General. It is unlawful to erect, construct, enlarge, alter,
repair, move, improve, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or structure within the city contrary to
the provisions of this code.

Subd. 2. Non-compliance. Failure to comply with a lawfully issued compliance order is a
violation of this code and is subject to enforcement procedures set forth in section 306 of city code.

Y




